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Item 1.01. Entry into a Material Definitive Agreement.

On October 7, 2020, Inari Medical, Inc. (the “Company”) entered into a lease agreement (the “New Lease”) with Oak Canyon Creek LLC (the “Landlord”)
for the lease of approximately 120,604 square feet of rentable area of the building located at 6001 Oak Canyon, Suite 100, Irvine, California 92618 (the
“Premises”). The New Lease commences on the earlier of (a) 30 weeks following the City of Irvine’s final approval of the Spectrum 7 zone change and (b)
the date the Company commences its regular business activities within the Premises (such date, the “Commencement Date”). The Company expects to use
the Premises as its new corporate headquarters and for research and development, production, assembly, manufacturing, distribution, training and other
related activities.

The term of the New Lease (the “Term”) is 120 months, plus such additional days as may be required to cause the New Lease to expire on the final day of a
calendar month. The New Lease provides for annual base rent of approximately $1.5 million in the first year of the Term, which increases on a yearly basis
up to approximately $2.8 million for the final year of the Term. The Company will also be responsible for the payment of additional rent to cover the
Company’s share of the annual operating expenses and property taxes of the building. Pursuant to the New Lease, the Company delivered a letter of credit
to the Landlord in the amount of $1.5 million.

In the event of a default of certain of the Company’s obligations under the New Lease, the Landlord has the right to terminate the New Lease and recover
damages as provided by the New Lease and by law.

The Company will be entitled to a one-time improvement allowance of approximately $4.1 million for costs related to the design and construction of
Company improvements to the Premises. In addition, the Company shall have the right to extend the lease for two extension periods of 60 months each,
subject to certain limitations and conditions.

The foregoing description of the New Lease is qualified in its entirety by reference to the New Lease, a copy of which will be filed as an exhibit to the
Company’s Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q for the quarterly period ended September 30, 2020.

Item 1.02. Termination of a Material Definitive Agreement.

On October 7, 2020, the Company and Bake Technology Park LLC (the “Former Landlord”) entered into a lease termination agreement (the “Termination
Agreement”) to terminate that certain lease, by and between the Company and Former Landlord, dated March 6, 2019 (the “Existing Lease”). The
Termination Agreement provides that the Existing Lease will terminate 90 days following the Commencement Date of the New Lease, with an option for
the Company to extend the Existing Lease for up to three 30 day periods. The Company will not be required to pay the landlord a termination payment or
penalty in connection with the early termination of the Existing Lease. Prior to the execution of the Termination Agreement, the Existing Lease had been
scheduled to expire in September 2024.  

The foregoing description of the Termination Agreement is qualified in its entirety by reference to the Termination Agreement, a copy of which will be
filed as an exhibit to the Company’s Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q for the quarterly period ended September 30, 2020.
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Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the registrant has duly caused this report to be signed on its behalf by the
undersigned hereunto duly authorized.
 
  INARI MEDICAL, INC.
    
Date: October 13, 2020  By: /s/ William Hoffman
   William Hoffman
   President and Chief Executive Officer
    
 
 

 


